PRODUCT PRICING SUMMARY BASED ON CONTRACT
BUYBOARD #601-19
Grapevine Dodge Chrysler Jeep 2601 William D Tate, Grapevine, TX 76051

End Use: PANOLA COUNTY
Contact: MELANIE EARLE

Rep:

Phone:817-410-7541

Phone/Email: MELANIE EARLE@CO.PANOLA.TX.US Email:_dthomas@grapevinedci.com

Product Description: 2020 RAM 2500 CREW CAB 4X4 r3a stock Date: 08/20/2020

23,966
A.  Bid Series 2500 A. Base Price:
B.  Published Options [Itemize each below
5 Code Options Bid Price Code Options Bid Price
DJ7HI1 | CREW CAB 4X4 SHORT BED LONE | 11,014 2HY LONESTAR DIESEL/AISEN 9021
PPX PATRIOT BLUE 97 MJX8 DIESEL GRAY BUCKETS 286
[ LPD CARGO CAMERA 335 LHL AUX SWITCHES 141
| WRJ 20" POLICHED ALUM WHEELS 1547 DSA ANTI SPIN AXLE 432
| BAJ 220A ALTERNATOR 97 AB3 LEVEL 2 EQQUIPMENT GROUP 4743
CLF RUBBER MATS 146 ARC OFF ROAD PACKAGE 432
. AAU SAFETY GROUP 1935 UAX 12" SCREEN NAVIGATION 835
Total of B. Published Options: | 30,961
C.  Unpublished Options 5 0.0%
Options Bid Price Options Bid Price
RETAIL LOT PREP 495
;
. LOCATED VICTORIA DODGE
§,
' Total of C. Unpublished Options: | 495
D. Pre-delivery Inspection: [
E. Texas State Inspection: [_5—___]
F. Manufacturer Destination/Delivery: I S l
G. Floor Plan Interest (for in-stock and/or equipped vehicles): l 8575 l
H. Lot Insurance (for in stock and/or equipped vehicles): I::
L Contract Price Adjustment: :]
J. Additional Delivery Charge: miles 350
K. Subtotal: 56,347
L. Quantity Ordered XK=
M. Trade in: l
N. BUYBOARD Administrative Fee ($400 per purchase order) 400.00
0.

TOTAL PURCHASE PRICE INCLUDING BUYBOARD FEE
%I 4,,”\ Jngo  SEP 15N



Melanie Earle

From: Connie Burkett <Connie Burkett@tasb.org>
Sent: Thursday, September 10; 2020 1:17 PM

To: Melanie Earle

Subject: FW: Dodge Ram 2500

Attachments: Invoice_20200904, 0001.pdf

Quote and invoice are both in compliance with the vendor’s contract.
Respectfully,

‘Connie W. Burkelt, CTSB0
Director of Cooperative Operations
BuyBoard / TASB

12007 Research Blvd

Austin TX 78759

Phone: 800-695-2919, ext 7152

[ T7Board’

@ Eoogerative Purchasing

**Notice to Members submitting quote review requests: Due to the high volume of quote verification requests, you
are asked to please aliow 2 business days for processing.**

From: Melanie Earle <melanie.earle@co.panola.tx.us>
Sent: Thursday, September 10, 2020 11:52 AM

To: Connie Burkett <Connie.Burkett@tasb.org>
Subject: RE: Dodge Ram 2500

Here is the corrected invoice.

From: Connie Burkett <Connige.Burkétt@tasb.org>
Sent: Thursday, September 10, 2020 11:35 AM

To: Melanie Earle <melanie.earle@co.panola.tx.us>
Subject: FW: Dodge Ram 2500

If the quote was for $56,747, why is the invoice for $59,600?
Respectfully,

Connie W. Burkett, CT5B0
Director of Cooperative Operations
BuyBoard / TASB

12007 Research Blvd.

Austin TX 78759

Phone: 800-695-2919, ext 7152

[TTBoard’

D tooperative Porchasing




**Notice to Members submitting quote review requests: Due to the high volume of quote verification requests, you
are asked to please allow 2 business days for processing.**

From: Melanie Earle <melanig.earle@co.panoia.tx.us»
Sent: Tuesday, September 8, 2020 11:21 AM

To: Connie Burkett <Connie.Burkeit@tash.org>
Subject: Dodge Ram 2500

Connie,

We purchased a Dodge Ram from Grapevine DCJ. They delivered the truck over the weekend so1 was not able to look
at the paperwork until today. They sent us a 2020 Dodge and the original quote was for a 2021. | have attached all the
paper work for this truck. I've-also attached the new quote he sent me this. morning. Could you let me know which one is
in compliance with buyboard?

Thanks,

Melanie Earle

Panola County Road and Bridge Dept.
Road and Bridge Warehouse Coordinator
1121 East Sabine

Carthage, TX 75633

Office: (903) 693-3763

Fax: (903) 693-5368



